
BID 
ITEM QTY UNIT UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL

1 2,500 GAL SYNTHETIC BLEND MOTOR OIL 5.96$         14,900.00$      10.36$       25,900.00$      6.99$          17,475.00$         6.80$         17,000.00$      

5W30

2 2,500 GAL SYNTHETIC BLEND MOTOR OIL 7.51$         18,775.00$      8.00$         20,000.00$      7.99$          19,975.00$         8.30$         20,750.00$      

15W40

3 550 GAL FULL SYNTHETIC MOTOR OIL 15.09$       8,299.50$        24.42$       13,431.00$      18.00$        9,900.00$           17.90$       9,845.00$        

5W40 - DEISEL ENGINES

4 1100 GAL SYNTHETIC BLEND MOTOR OIL 8.90$         9,790.00$        10.86$       11,946.00$      515.00$      566,500.00$       10.00$       11,000.00$      

15W40

5 240 QT SYNTHETIC BLEND MOTOR OIL 2.39$         573.60$           4.17$         1,000.80$        44.00$        10,560.00$         3.20$         768.00$           

5W30

6 240 QT SYNTHETIC BLEND MOTOR OIL 2.81$         674.40$           4.64$         1,113.60$        41.25$        9,900.00$           3.70$         888.00$           

15W40

7 120 GAL SYNTHETIC BLEND MOTOR OIL 11.23$       1,347.60$        18.81$       2,257.20$        41.25$        4,950.00$           14.90$       1,788.00$        

15W40

8 480 QT CASTROL GTX MOTOR OIL 3.90$         1,872.00$        5.67$         2,721.60$        47.00$        22,560.00$         5.70$         2,736.00$        

5W30

9 480 QT FULL SYNTHETIC MOTOR OIL 4.31$         2,068.80$        5.04$         2,419.20$        1,250.00$   600,000.00$       6.50$         3,120.00$        

0W-40

10 960 QT FULL SYNTHETIC MOTOR OIL 3.92$         3,763.20$        5.04$         4,838.40$        47.00$        45,120.00$         3.70$         3,552.00$        

5W-20

SAFETY-KLEEN                  

NORWELL, MA

BILO WHOLESALE                     

DENISON, TX

BID # 25-20 AUTOMOTIVE LUBRICATING OILS & GREASE 2025

HAIGOOD & CAMPBELL                               

ARCHER CITY, TX

SUN COAST RESOURCES             

HOUSTON, TX

ITEM DESCRIPTION
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BID 
ITEM QTY UNIT UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL

11 550 GAL ENGINE OIL, SAE 15W40 8.90$         4,895.00$        19.03$       10,466.50$      7.99$          4,394.50$           10.10$       5,555.00$        

DELO, PREFERRED CHOICE HDD

CJ-4/SM OR ROTELLA

12 550 GAL ENGINE OIL, SAE 10W 9.33$         5,131.50$        3.90$         2,145.00$        12.70$       6,985.00$        

13 120 QT ENGINE OIL, SAE 30W 2.87$         344.40$           1.19$         142.80$           4.80$         576.00$           

14 220 GAL ENGINE OIL, SAE 30W 11.25$       2,475.00$        3.90$         858.00$           14.90$       3,278.00$        

15 240 QT FULL SYNTHETIC ENGINE OIL 3.87$         928.80$           2.52$         604.80$           53.00$        12,720.00$         4.00$         960.00$           

SAE 0W20 DEXOS APPROVED

16 480 QT FULL SYNTHETIC ENGINE OIL 3.87$         1,857.60$        2.52$         1,209.60$        525.00$      252,000.00$       3.70$         1,776.00$        

SAE 5W20 DEXOS APPROVED

17 240 QT FULL SYNTHETIC ENGINE OIL 3.87$         928.80$           2.52$         604.80$           53.00$        12,720.00$         3.90$         936.00$           

SAE 5W30 DEXOS APPROVED

18 60 GAL ENGINE OIL, SAE 10W30 11.37$       682.20$           24.09$       1,445.40$        7.99$          479.40$              19.00$       1,140.00$        

SHELL ROTELLA T5 ULTRA LOW

19 300 GAL FULL SYNTHETIC ENGINE OIL, 20.29$       6,087.00$        29.33$       8,799.00$        27.00$       8,100.00$        
5W30 DELO 400 XSP

20 880 GAL ENGINE OIL, SAE 10W30 7.61$         6,696.80$        19.03$       16,746.40$      7.99$          7,031.20$           16.60$       14,608.00$      

DELO 400 XLE

21 880 GAL ENGINE OIL, SAE 15W40 8.90$         7,832.00$        19.03$       16,746.40$      7.99$          7,031.20$           10.00$       8,800.00$        

DELO 400 SDE

22 440 GAL HYDRAULIC OIL, ISO 68 6.13$         2,697.20$        9.74$         4,285.60$        6.80$          2,992.00$           8.90$         3,916.00$        

ITEM DESCRIPTION

HAIGOOD & CAMPBELLBILO WHOLESALE

NO BID

SAFETY-KLEEN SUN COAST RESOURCES

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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BID 
ITEM QTY UNIT UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL

23 2500 GAL HYDRAULIC OIL, ISO 68 5.04$         12,600.00$      6.79$         16,975.00$      6.80$          17,000.00$         7.90$         19,750.00$      

24 300 GAL HYDRAULIC OIL, AW 32 4.47$         1,341.00$        9.32$         2,796.00$        6.20$          1,860.00$           8.50$         2,550.00$        

25 360 LB GEAR LUBE, SAE 80W90 1.47$         529.20$           2.06$         741.60$           69.25$        24,930.00$         2.50$         900.00$           

120 LB

26 1200 LB GEAR LUBE, SAE 85W140 1.82$         2,184.00$        12.56$       15,072.00$      74.50$        89,400.00$         2.60$         3,120.00$        

ALL-PURPOSE GEAR LUBRICANT

GL5

27 550 GAL TRACTOR HYDRAULIC FLUID 7.94$         4,367.00$        12.96$       7,128.00$        8.00$          4,400.00$           9.98$         5,489.00$        

PTIII

28 1200 GAL TRACTOR HYDRAULIC FLUID 6.42$         7,704.00$        12.86$       15,432.00$      6.80$          8,160.00$           8.60$         10,320.00$      

PTIII

29 240 QT TRANSMISSION FLUID 2.73$         655.20$           3.30$         792.00$           33.25$        7,980.00$           3.65$         876.00$           

DEXTRON III

30 240 QT TRANSMISSION FLUID 4.13$         991.20$           5.69$         1,365.60$        44.50$        10,680.00$         5.40$         1,296.00$        

DEXTRON VI

31 1100 GAL TRANSMISSION FLUID 18.56$       20,416.00$      48.49$       53,339.00$      1,125.00$   1,237,500.00$    36.90$       40,590.00$      

TES 295 SPEC.

TRANSYND SYNTHETIC

32 550 GAL TRANSMISSION FLUID 9.46$         5,203.00$        19.22$       10,571.00$      620.00$      341,000.00$       12.84$       7,062.00$        

ALLFLEET TO-4 10W

CAT TO-4 SPECS

33 550 GAL TRANSMISSION FLUID 9.69$         5,329.50$        17.40$       9,570.00$        670.00$      368,500.00$       12.90$       7,095.00$        

ALLFLEET TO-4 30W

CAT TO-4 SPECS

ITEM DESCRIPTION

BILO WHOLESALE HAIGOOD & CAMPBELL SAFETY-KLEEN SUN COAST RESOURCES
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BID 
ITEM QTY UNIT UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL

34 240 QT TRANSMISSION FLUID 4.58$         1,099.20$        5.13$         1,231.20$        45.50$        10,920.00$         5.40$         1,296.00$        

MERCON V

35 1200 LB LITHIUM COMPLEX GREASE 2.74$         3,288.00$        4.05$         4,860.00$        375.00$      450,000.00$       3.60$         4,320.00$        

EP2 120LB

36 1200 LB LITHIUM COMPLEX GREASE 3.00$         3,600.00$        5.86$         7,032.00$        3.66$         4,392.00$        

EP-0  55 GALLON DRUMS

SUBTOTAL 171,927.70$    296,587.50$    4,178,638.30$    237,133.00$    

37 1500 GAL ENGINE OIL, SAE 15W40 7.51$         11,265.00$      18.92$       28,380.00$      7.99$          11,985.00$         14.09$       21,135.00$      

DELO

38 840 GAL GEAR LUBE, SAE 85W140 10.42$       8,752.80$        12.56$       10,550.40$      14.25$        11,970.00$         10.00$       8,400.00$        

ALL-PURPOSE GEAR

LUBRICANT, GL5

39 840 GAL TRANSMISSION FLUID 18.00$       15,120.00$      48.49$       40,731.60$      1,125.00$   945,000.00$       36.90$       30,996.00$      

TES 295 SPEC 

TRANSYND SYNTHETIC

TEXAS USED OIL FEE $0.04/GAL

DRUM DEPOSIT CHARGES

SUBTOTAL 35,137.80$      79,662.00$      968,955.00$       60,531.00$      

  

TOTAL 207,065.50$    376,249.50$    5,147,593.30$    297,664.00$    

ITEM DESCRIPTION

BILO WHOLESALE HAIGOOD & CAMPBELL SAFETY-KLEEN

N/A  N/A 

ITEMS 37 - 39: TRANSIT MAINTENANCE FACILITY - 2004 WINDTHORST RD

SUN COAST RESOURCES

N/A  N/A 

NO BID
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