BID 22-47 TABULATION

2022 Sewer Budget Utility Improvement Project - Phase 2
CWEF22-550-10
BID DATE: AUGUST 2, 2022

Bowles Construction Co., BRCT LLC DBA B‘Iack Rock
BASE BID Wichita Falls, TX Construction,
Mansfield, TX
Pay Item Description Unit [Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
107-TS Trench Safety System LF 2461 $10.00 $24,610.00 $4.00 $9,844.00
200.1 Ste Prep & Mobilization (Not to Exceed 5%) LS 1 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $78,000.00 $78,000.00
201 Erosion Control LS 1 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $34,000.00 $34,000.00
202.1-TR Tree Removal EA 3 $3,500.00 $10,500.00 $1,500.00 $4,500.00
203.3-RP Remove Existing Pavement SY 503 $20.00 $10,060.00 $15.00 $7,545.00
305.1-CG Install 6" Curb & Gutter LF 48 $30.00 $1,440.00 $100.00 $4,800.00
305.2-DA [Install 6" Reinforced Concrete Drive Approach SY 53 $80.00 $4,240.00 $200.00 $10,600.00
305.2-PR Pedestrian Ramp EA 3 $4,000.00 $12,000.00 $4,000.00 $12,000.00
305.2-SW [Install 4" Reinforced Concrete Sidewalk SY 327 $60.00 $19,620.00 $135.00 $44,145.00
402-PR Pavement Repair SY 116 $150.00 $17,400.00 $313.00 $36,308.00
501.17-6 Install 6" SDR 26 PVC Sanitary Sewer Pipe LF 82 $380.00 $31,160.00 $390.00 $31,980.00
501.17-18 Install 18" PS 115 PVC Sanitary Sewer Pipe LF 485 $300.00 $145,500.00 $410.00 $198,850.00
501.17-24 Install 24" PS 115 PVC Sanitary Sewer Pipe LF 1894 $350.00 $662,900.00 $425.00 $804,950.00
502.1-A Abandon Sanitary Sewer Manhole EA 2 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $8,900.00 $17,800.00
502.1-N Install New 4' Dia Sanitary Sewer Manhole EA 2 $9,000.00 $18,000.00 $14,485.00 $28,970.00
502.1-RR Rem & Rep 4' Dia Sanitary Sewer Manhole EA 4 $8,000.00 $32,000.00 $16,160.00 $64,640.00
502.1-RRE  [Rem & Rep 4' Dia Sanitary Sewer Manhole w/ External Drop EA 1 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $27,110.00 $27,110.00
502.2-CO Rem & Rep Sanitary Sewer Cleanout EA 1 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $9,005.00 $9,005.00
502.9-WC [Warren Manhole Coating SF 600 $60.00 $36,000.00 $75.00 $45,000.00
503-10 Install 10" Steel Casing LF 42 $300.00 $12,600.00 $450.00 $18,900.00
503-28 Install 30" Steel Casing LF 50 $500.00 $25,000.00 $535.00 $26,750.00
506.8-CP Cut & Plug Sewer Line EA 2 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $4,000.00 $8,000.00
702-JB 4x5 Reinforced Concrete Junction Box EA 1 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00
801 Temporary Barricading and Traffic Control LS 1 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00
Engineers Estimate: $930,000.00 TOTAL $1,192,530.00] |TOTAL $1,598,697.00
ADD/ALT #1 Bowles Construction Co., BRCT t;cnsDtchfiljr:k Rock
Wichita Falls, TX ) !
Mansfield, TX
Pay Item Description Unit [Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

503-10-ALT |Bore & Install 10" Steel Casing LF 42 NO BID NO BID $1,400.00 $58,800.00
702-JB-ALT |4' Reinforced Concrete Junction Box EA 1 NO BID NO BID $29,075.00 $29,075.00
Engineers Estimate: $29,000.00 TOTAL NO BID TOTAL $87,875.00
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Bowles Construction Co.,

BRCT LLC DBA Black Rock

ADD/ALT #2 Wichita Falls, TX Construction,
Mansfield, TX
Pay Item Description Unit [Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
107-TS-ALT |Trench Safety System LF 544 $20.00 $10,880.00 $2.00 $1,088.00
501.17-18-ALT [Install 18" PS 115 PVC Sanitary Sewer Pipe LF 544 $300.00 $163,200.00 $285.00 $155,040.00
502.1-RR-ALT [Rem & Rep 4' Dia Sanitary Sewer Manhole EA 1 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $12,791.00 $12,791.00
502.9-WC-ALT [Warren Manhole Coating SF 100 $60.00 $6,000.00 $75.00 $7,500.00
Engineers Estimate: $125,000.00 TOTAL $188,080.00] |TOTAL $176,419.00
ADD/ALT #3 Bowles Construction Co., BRCT t:lfnsDtchfiljr:k Rock
Wichita Falls, TX !
Mansfield, TX
Pay Item Description Unit [Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

107-TS-ALT |Trench Safety System LF 62 $30.00 $1,860.00 $2.00 $124.00
201-ALT Erosion Control LS 1 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00
203.3-RP-ALT [Remove Existing Pavement SY 15 $100.00 $1,500.00 $75.00 $1,125.00
303-6-ALT |Reinforced 6" Concrete Channel Repair SY 15 $200.00 $3,000.00 $300.00 $4,500.00
51.17-8-ALT [Install 8" SDR 26 PVC Sanitary Sewer Pipe LF 62 $300.00 $18,600.00 $180.00 $11,160.00
502.1-RR-ALT [Rem & Rep 4' Dia Sanitary Sewer Manhole EA 1 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $12,790.00 $12,790.00
502.9-WC-ALT |Warren Manhole Coating SF 90 $60.00 $5,400.00 $75.00 $6,750.00
503-12-ALT |Install 12" Steel Casing LF 35 $250.00 $8,750.00 $275.00 $9,625.00
Engineers Estimate: $38,000.00 TOTAL $48,610.00] |TOTAL $49,074.00






